CITY OF CORAL GABLES
FINANCE DEPARTMENT / PROCUREMENT DIVISION
PROJECT RECEIPT LOG

Opening Date:
March 17, 2023, at 2:00 PM

Project Number & Title:
IFB 2023-007

Pest Management Services

Bidder Name Amount
[ e R e ey -] Group] Group 2 Group 3

Sprague Operating LLC dba Beach Environmental $12,596.00 $8,525.00 $5,645.00
El Toro Terminator of Florida, Inc. $14,291.60 $1,875.00 $1,270.00
F&O Pestmanagement LLC DBA Pestmaster of Miami Beach $18,742.00 No Bid $12,500.00
On Brand Pest Management $47,225.00 No Bid $1,500.00
Orange Pest Control & Services, Inc. $15,800.00 No Bid No Bid

Power Exterminator $14,060.00 $13,750.00 $17,400.00
Southern Service Solutions $10,784.40 $142,175.00 $9,575.00
Tower Pest Control, Inc. $12,588.00 No Bid $11,500.00

Printed Name:) Tnya D. Doniga
Opened/Received by: ? V\Q 3/ /
Signature: Qu/(«q arv / 7 920 23
Printed Name?) %Lf
Witnessed by:
Signature: Z IA@JA M;@Z(AAW»\ ‘3’/’7 /020023

NOTE: Please be advised that this log only reflects the submittals received for the project referenced above. It is no way intended to
indicate the results of the evaluation process and subsequent award.



